



BID COMPARISON

RFB # 10-1920 HVAC Parts & Supplies

Bid Due Date & Time: 4/21/2020 11:00 AM PST

Completed By: Toni Sampo, Purchasing Agent

		ALLIED REFRIGERATION INC.	GEORGE T. HALL CO., INC.	JOHNSTONE SUPPLY LONG BEACH	TRANE SUPPLY	VALVE INDUSTRIES INC.
LOT	DESCRIPTION	LOT TOTAL	LOT TOTAL	LOT TOTAL	LOT TOTAL	LOT TOTAL
1	ASCO REDHAT	\$809.00	\$982.00	\$934.54	\$1,065.92	NO BID
2	BARBER COLMAN	\$3,271.00	\$4,248.00	\$3,241.00	\$3,768.30	-
3	BELL & GOSSETT	\$836.00	\$982.00	\$755.48	\$950.21	NO BID
4	CARRIER	\$21,741.00	NO BID	-	\$12,262.68	NO BID
5	COMFORT-AIRE	\$17,578.00	NO BID	\$10,555.48	NO BID	NO BID
6	COPELAND	\$2,254.00	NO BID	\$2,512.74	\$1,932.32	-
7	FUJITSU	\$6,502.00	NO BID	\$4,479.48	-	NO BID
8	HOFFMAN	\$1,780.00	\$2,800.00	\$1,881.11	\$2,464.00	NO BID
9	HONEYWELL	\$2,330.00	\$3,586.00	\$2,710.83	\$1,631.19	-
10	REFRIGERANTS	\$10,612.50	NO BID	NO BID	\$10,734.45	NO BID
11	SOLAIR	\$1,300.00	NO BID	\$1,211.06	\$1,592.90	NO BID
12	TECUMSEH	\$961.00	NO BID	\$1,223.14	\$1,541.16	NO BID
13	TRANE	\$17,803.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$14,519.19	\$20,411.00
14	WILLIAMS	\$6,534.00	NO BID	\$3,351.92	\$3,524.02	NO BID