



BID COMPARISON

RFB #: 01-1718 Specialized Health Care Equipment
 Submission Due Date & Time: 06/29/17 at 11a.m.
 Completed By: E. Mandell

LOT 1				School Health Corporation		Rifton Equipment	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
1	2	Each	Hoyer Lift #HML400	\$581.86	\$1,163.72		
2	2	Each	Hoyer Lift Sling #70010/11/12/13 Med	\$103.66	\$207.32		
3	2	Each	Hoyer Lift Sling #70010/11/12/13 Large	\$103.66	\$207.32		
TOTAL LOT 1					\$1,578.36		NO BID

LOT 2				School Health Corporation		Rifton Equipment	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
4	1	Each	Armedica Treatment Table w/ Shelf AM-604	\$427.06	\$427.06		
TOTAL LOT 2					\$427.06		NO BID

LOT 3				School Health Corporation		Rifton Equipment	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
5	6	Each	PT Stoll w/ Casters #750	\$91.46	\$548.76		
TOTAL LOT 3					\$548.76		NO BID

LOT 4				School Health Corporation		Rifton Equipment	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
6	6		Especial Needs Folding Mat 4'x6' E0450	\$240.18	\$1,441.08		
7	4		Especial Needs Bean Bag Chair F04487, Large	\$175.55	\$702.20		
8	4		Especial Needs Multi-Use Adjustable Chair E02142, Large	\$829.09	\$3,316.36		
9	4		Tumble Forms 2 Deluxe Floor Sitter SKU# T03152B, Large	\$573.69	\$2,294.76		
10	4		Tumble Forms 2 Deluxe Floor Sitter Tray SKU# T02096B	\$906.19	\$3,624.76		
TOTAL LOT 4					\$11,379.16		NO BID

LOT 5				School Health Corporation		Rifton Equipment	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
11	6	Each	Mobile Prone Stander, Frame: K170, Large			\$3,446.25	\$20,677.50
12	2	Each	New Pacer Gait Trainer (no dynamic frame) K640, Large			\$3,138.75	\$6,277.50
13	2	Each	New Pacer Gait Trainer (with dynamic frame) K640, Large			\$3,120.00	\$6,240.00
14	4	Each	XL Pacer Gait Trainer K650 , X-Large			\$3,551.25	\$14,205.00
15	2	Each	Adaptive Toilet - Large HTS Toilet & Shower Chair Z130			\$2,151.75	\$4,303.50
16	3	Each	Rifton Activity Chair - Medium Hi/Lo Base R850, Medium			\$3,654.00	\$10,962.00
17	2	Each	Rifton Activity Chair - Large Hi/Lo Base R870, Large			\$3,921.75	\$7,843.50
18	2	Each	Rifton Tricycle R140, Large, Lime			\$2,287.50	\$4,575.00
19	1	Each	Rifton Support Station K710			\$2,727.75	\$2,727.75
20	2	Each	Rifton TRAM K310			\$4,946.25	\$9,892.50
23	1	Each	Rifton R130 Tricycle Medium			\$1,792.50	\$1,792.50
24	1	Each	Rifton R830 Activity Chair - Small HI/LO Base			\$3,115.50	\$3,115.50
TOTAL LOT 5					NO BID		\$92,612.25

LOT 6

LOT 6				School Health Corporation		Rifton Equipment	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
21	1	Each	Evolve Easy Stand Medium PNG50499				
22	1	Each	Evolve Easy Stand Large PNG50400				
TOTAL LOT 6					NO BID		NO BID