



BID COMPARISON

RFB #: 44-1617 Manufacturing Lab Equipment
 Bid Due Date & Time: 4/19/17 11:00 a.m.
 Completed By: Toni Sampo, Purchasing Agent

LOT#	Qty	UOM	Description	Paton Group		Haas Factory Outlet, LLC		MakerBot	
				Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
1	1	EA	BOFA Advantage 500 IQ		\$10,415.35		No Bid		No Bid
2	1	EA	Forest Scientific HS Router		\$32,171.96		No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid
3	1	EA	Haas TL-1 CNC Toolroom Lathe		No Bid		\$28,785.40	\$0.00	No Bid
4	1	EA	Haas TM-1P CNC Toolroom Mills		No Bid		\$114,496.96	\$0.00	No Bid
5	1	EA	Haas VF-2 Machining Center		No Bid		\$51,095.92	\$0.00	No Bid
6	1	EA	Intelitek Learnmate & CNCMotion		\$6,365.50		No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid
7	1	EA	Intelitek Promill 8000		\$39,860.59		No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid
8	1	EA	Intelitek Proturn 9000		\$28,385.99		No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid
9	1	EA	MakerBot Eduplus Bundles		\$60,765.00		No Bid	\$7,663.58	\$61,308.64
10	1	EA	Roland Camm-1 Vinyly Cutters		\$5,323.35		No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid
11	1	EA	Roland MDX40A Milling Machines		\$27,269.98		No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid
12	1	EA	Roland MDX50 Milling Machines		\$32,621.41		No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid
13	1	EA	Roland MDX540A Milling Machine		\$44,090.46		No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid
14	1	EA	Stratasys F170 Printer System		\$56,444.78		No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid
15	1	EA	Universal Lasers VLS460		\$51,442.38		No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid
Subtotal				\$0.00	\$395,156.75		\$194,378.28		\$61,308.64
Other									
Total Bid Amount					\$395,156.75		\$194,378.28		\$61,308.64