

BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 08-1617
 Submission Due Date & Time: 07/29/16 at 11:00am
 Completed By: E. Herrera

No Award
 Award
 Rejected

			LOT 1	Community Products, LLC			Medicale Shop Inc.			School Health Corporation		
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES
1	2	Each	Rifton K150 Mobile Stander, Medium	\$3,193.00	\$6,386.00		\$3,405.00	\$6,810.00		\$3,756.47	\$7,512.94	
2	4	Each	Rifton K170 Mobile Stander, Large	\$3,736.00	\$14,944.00		\$3,985.00	\$15,940.00		\$4,395.29	\$17,581.16	
3	2	Each	Rifton Z120 Adaptive Toilet, Medium, Hygiene and Toileting System	\$1,680.00	\$3,360.00		\$1,790.00	\$3,580.00		\$1,976.47	\$3,952.94	
4	4	Each	Rifton Z130 Adaptive Toilet, Large, Hygiene and Toileting System	\$2,081.00	\$8,324.00		\$2,220.00	\$8,880.00		\$2,448.24	\$9,792.96	
5	2	Each	Rifton R140 Adaptive Tricycle, Large	\$2,241.00	\$4,482.00		\$2,390.00	\$4,780.00		\$2,636.47	\$5,272.94	
6	2	Each	Rifton R130 Adaptive Tricycle, Medium	\$1,855.00	\$3,710.00		\$1,975.00	\$3,950.00		\$2,182.35	\$4,364.70	
7	5	Each	Rifton R850 Mobile Activity Chair, Medium	\$3,648.00	\$18,240.00		\$3,890.00	\$19,450.00		\$4,291.76	\$21,458.80	
8	6	Each	Rifton R870 Mobile Activity Chair, Large	\$4,189.00	\$25,134.00		\$4,465.00	\$26,790.00		\$4,928.24	\$29,569.44	
9	5	Each	Rifton K630 Dynamic Pacer, Medium	\$2,104.00	\$10,520.00		\$2,245.00	\$11,225.00		\$2,475.29	\$12,376.45	
10	2	Each	Rifton K640 Dynamic Pacer, Large	\$2,283.00	\$4,566.00		\$2,985.00	\$5,970.00		\$2,685.89	\$5,371.78	
11	2	Each	Rifton R140 Adaptive Tricycle, Large	\$2,241.00	\$4,482.00		\$2,390.00	\$4,780.00		\$2,636.47	\$5,272.94	
12	2	Each	Rifton K640 Dynamic Pacer, Large	\$2,283.00	\$4,566.00		\$2,985.00	\$5,970.00		\$2,685.89	\$5,371.78	
13	6	Each	Rifton K150 Mobile Stander, Medium	\$3,193.00	\$19,158.00		\$3,405.00	\$20,430.00		\$3,756.47	\$22,538.82	
14	3	Each	Rifton Z110 Adaptive Toilet, Small, Hygiene and Toileting System	\$1,514.00	\$4,542.00		\$1,610.00	\$4,830.00		\$1,781.18	\$5,343.54	
15	3	Each	Rifton R120 Adaptive Tricycle, Medium	\$1,612.00	\$4,836.00		\$1,715.00	\$5,145.00		\$1,896.47	\$5,689.41	
16	6	Each	Rifton K630 Dynamic Pacer, Medium	\$2,104.00	\$12,624.00		\$2,245.00	\$13,470.00		\$2,475.29	\$14,851.74	
Subtotal				\$39,957.00	\$149,874.00			\$162,000.00			\$176,322.34	
Sales Tax (9%)					\$13,488.66			\$14,580.00			\$15,869.01	
Total Bid Amount					\$163,362.66			\$176,580.00			\$192,191.35	

BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 08-1617
 Submission Due Date & Time: 07/29/16 at 11:00am
 Completed By: E. Herrera

No Award
 Award
 Rejected

			LOT 2	Community Products, LLC			Medicale Shop Inc.			School Health Corporation		
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES
17	4	Each	Armedica AM-604 Treatment Table with shelf				\$575.00	\$2,300.00		\$427.06	\$1,708.24	
Subtotal								\$2,300.00			\$1,708.24	
Sales Tax (9%)								\$207.00			\$153.74	
Total Bid Amount					No Bid			\$2,507.00			\$1,861.98	

BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 08-1617
 Submission Due Date & Time: 07/29/16 at 11:00am
 Completed By: E. Herrera

No Award
 Award
 Rejected

			LOT 3	Community Products, LLC			Medicale Shop Inc.			School Health Corporation		
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES
18	5	Each	Hoyer Hydraulic Patient Lifter, Model HML400				\$650.00	\$3,250.00		\$581.86	\$2,909.30	
Subtotal								\$3,250.00			\$2,909.30	
Sales Tax (9%)								\$292.50			\$261.84	
Total Bid Amount					No Bid			\$3,542.50			\$3,171.14	

BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 08-1617
 Submission Due Date & Time: 07/29/16 at 11:00am
 Completed By: E. Herrera

No Award
 Award
 Rejected

			LOT 4	Community Products, LLC			Medicale Shop Inc.			School Health Corporation		
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES
19	11	Each	ESpecialNeeds Multi-Use Classroom Chair, Large, Model #E02142				\$745.00	\$8,195.00		\$655.06	\$7,205.66	
20	3	Each	ESpecialNeeds Multi-Use Classroom Chair, Small, Model #E02141				\$650.00	\$1,950.00		\$568.94	\$1,706.82	
21	6	Each	Tumble Forms 2 Deluxe Floor Sitter, Medium, Model #T03151B				\$950.00	\$5,700.00		\$1,008.60	\$6,051.60	
22	5	Each	Tumble Forms 2 Deluxe Floor Sitter, Large, Model #T03152T				\$1,050.00	\$5,250.00		\$1,110.08	\$5,550.40	
Subtotal								\$21,095.00			\$20,514.48	
Sales Tax (9%)								\$1,898.55			\$1,846.30	
Total Bid Amount					No Bid			\$22,993.55			\$22,360.78	

BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 08-1617
 Submission Due Date & Time: 07/29/16 at 11:00am
 Completed By: E. Herrera

No Award
 Award
 Rejected

LOT 5				Community Products, LLC			Medicale Shop Inc.			School Health Corporation		
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES	Each	Ext Cost	NOTES
23	1	Each	Evolv E3 Stand, Medium, Model #PNG50410				\$4,745.00	\$4,745.00				
24	1	Each	Evolv E3 Stand, Large, Model #PNG50400				\$4,850.00	\$4,850.00				
Subtotal								\$9,595.00				
Sales Tax (9%)								\$863.55				
Total Bid Amount					No Bid			\$10,458.55			No Bid	