

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: RFB# 42-1516-1575  
 Submission Due Date & Time: 7/29/2016 11:00am  
 Completed By: Marcos

No Award  
 Award  
 Rejected

## LOT 1

Vendor Name	Item No.	Qty	UOM	LOT 1	Ext Cost	Sales Tax	Total Bid	NOTES
Golden Star Technology Inc	1	42	Lot	\$3,880.41	\$162,977.22	\$14,667.95	\$177,645.17	
Apex Audio, Inc	1	42	Lot	\$4,163.98	\$174,887.16	\$15,739.84	\$190,627.00	
Troxell Communications, Inc	1	42	Lot	\$4,164.69	\$174,916.98	\$15,742.53	\$190,659.51	
PSSL ProSound & Stage Lighting	1	42	Lot	\$4,283.54	\$179,908.68	\$16,191.78	\$196,100.46	
Adorama Inc.	1	42	Lot	\$4,675.00	\$196,350.00	\$17,671.50	\$214,021.50	
Pathway Communications LTD	1	42	Lot	\$4,734.00	\$198,828.00	\$17,894.52	\$216,722.52	
Talk Technologies Inc	1	42	Lot	\$4,750.00	\$199,500.00	\$17,955.00	\$217,455.00	
DI Technology Group Inc	1	42	Lot	\$5,423.00	\$227,766.00	\$20,498.94	\$248,264.94	
VMI Inc	1	42	Lot	\$5,463.70	\$229,475.40	\$20,652.79	\$250,128.19	
Time and Alarm Systems	1	42	Lot	\$6,668.00	\$280,056.00	\$25,205.04	\$305,261.04	
Inter-Pacific Inc	1	42	Lot	\$9,047.81	\$380,008.02	\$34,200.72	\$414,208.74	
Advanced Classroom Technologies	1	42	Lot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
B&H Foto & Electronics Corp	1	42	Lot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Howard Technology Solutions	1	42	Lot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Office Depot	1	42	Lot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
SHI International Corp	1	42	Lot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Ward's Media Tech	1	42	Lot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: RFB# 42-1516-1575

Submission Due Date & Time: 7/29/2016 11:00am

Completed By: Marcos

No Award

Award

Rejected

## LOT 2

Vendor Name	Item No.	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Ext Cost	Sales Tax	Total Bid
Adorama Inc	1	150	Each	\$615.99	\$92,398.50	\$8,315.87	\$308,059.62
	2	350	Each	\$543.50	\$190,225.00	\$17,120.25	
Advanced Classroom Technologies	1	150	Each	\$429.00	\$64,350.00	\$5,791.50	\$290,648.50
	2	350	Each	\$578.00	\$202,300.00	\$18,207.00	
B&H Foto & Electronics Corp	1	150	Each	\$522.00	\$78,300.00	\$7,047.00	\$280,293.50
	2	350	Each	\$511.00	\$178,850.00	\$16,096.50	
DI Technology Group	1	150	Each	\$545.00	\$81,750.00	\$7,357.50	\$369,510.00
	2	350	Each	\$735.00	\$257,250.00	\$23,152.50	
Golden Star Technology Inc	1	150	Each	\$552.12	\$82,818.00	\$7,453.62	\$284,790.84
	2	350	Each	\$509.88	\$178,458.00	\$16,061.22	
Howard Technology Solutions	1	150	Each	\$575.00	\$86,250.00	\$7,762.50	\$301,167.00
	2	350	Each	\$543.00	\$190,050.00	\$17,104.50	
Inter-Pacific Inc	1	150	Each	\$754.00	\$113,100.00	\$10,179.00	\$384,225.00
	2	350	Each	\$684.00	\$239,400.00	\$21,546.00	
Office Depot, Inc	1	150	Each	\$528.71	\$79,306.50	\$7,137.59	\$302,312.05
	2	350	Each	\$565.84	\$198,044.00	\$17,823.96	
PSSL - ProSound and Stage Lighting	1	150	Each	\$775.41	\$116,311.50	\$10,468.04	\$394,031.73
	2	350	Each	\$700.53	\$245,185.50	\$22,066.70	
SHI International Corp	1	150	Each	\$554.90	\$83,235.00	\$7,491.15	\$287,885.35
	2	350	Each	\$516.80	\$180,880.00	\$16,279.20	
Troxell Communications, Inc	1	150	Each	\$554.81	\$83,221.50	\$7,489.94	\$285,345.11
	2	350	Each	\$510.18	\$178,563.00	\$16,070.67	
Time and Alarm Systems	1	150	Each	\$729.82	\$109,473.00	\$9,852.57	\$382,228.67
	2	350	Each	\$689.13	\$241,195.50	\$21,707.60	
VMI Inc	1	150	Each	\$635.00	\$95,250.00	\$8,572.50	\$315,555.00
	2	350	Each	\$555.00	\$194,250.00	\$17,482.50	