



BID COMPARISON

RFB #: 07-1920 Janitorial Supplies
 Submission Due Date & Time: 02/27/2020 at 11:00 A.M.
 Completed By: Edith Herrera

No Award
Award
Rejected

Description:		Singlefold Paper Towels, Apple Paper Soft Petals #3705-41 or equal			Tissue facial cleansing, 2 ply sheets,		
Quantity / UOM:		Qty: 5,500; UOM: Case			Qty: 36,000; UOM: Each		
Vendor:		Price / Case	Ext Cost	NOTES	Price / Each	Ext Cost	NOTES
1	American Textile Systems	\$14.55	\$80,025.00	Alternative	\$0.94	\$33,840.00	Alternative
2	Complete Office of CA, Inc.	\$14.40	\$79,200.00		NO BID	NO BID	
3	ECO Sanitary Supplies Inc.	\$15.50	\$85,250.00		\$1.07	\$38,400.00	
4	GCS Supplies Inc.	\$13.75	\$75,625.00	Alternative	\$0.68	\$24,480.00	
5	Grainger	\$17.49	\$96,195.00	Alternative	\$1.74	\$62,742.00	
6	Office Depot, Inc.	\$14.40	\$79,200.00	Alternative	\$0.54	\$19,284.00	Alternative
7	School Nurse Supply, Inc.	NO BID	NO BID		\$0.90	\$32,364.00	
8	Pantelides Dry Foods & Paper Supply	\$15.99	\$87,945.00		\$0.37	\$13,320.00	Alternative
9	Gale Supply Company	\$13.75	\$75,625.00	Alternative	\$0.61	\$21,960.00	
10	Gale Supply Company				\$0.29	\$10,440.00	Alternative
11	WAXIE Sanitary Supply	\$20.98	\$115,390.00	Alternative	\$0.83	\$30,024.00	
12	P & R Paper Supply Co.	\$14.78	\$81,290.00	Alternative	\$0.42	\$15,120.00	Alternative

1 Gale Alternative
 2 GCS Alternative
 3 Office Depot Alternative
 4 Complete Off. Check if Alt

1 Gale Alternative
 2 Pantelides Alternative
 3 P & R Paper Alternative



BID COMPARISON

RFB #: 07-1920 Janitorial Supplies
 Submission Due Date & Time: 02/27/2020 at 11:00 A.M.
 Completed By: Edith Herrera

No Award
 Award
 Rejected

Description:		Singlefold Paper Towels, Apple Paper Soft Petals #3705-41 or equal		
Quantity / UOM:		Qty: 5,500; UOM: Case		
Vendor:		Price / Case	Ext Cost	NOTES
1	American Textile Systems	\$14.55	\$80,025.00	Alternative
2	Complete Office of CA, Inc.	\$14.40	\$79,200.00	
3	ECO Sanitary Supplies Inc.	\$15.50	\$85,250.00	
4	GCS Supplies Inc.	\$13.75	\$75,625.00	Alternative
5	Grainger	\$17.49	\$96,195.00	Alternative
6	Office Depot, Inc.	\$14.40	\$79,200.00	Alternative
7	School Nurse Supply, Inc.	NO BID	NO BID	
8	Pantelides Dry Foods & Paper Supply	\$15.99	\$87,945.00	
9	Gale Supply Company	\$13.75	\$75,625.00	Alternative
11	WAXIE Sanitary Supply	\$20.98	\$115,390.00	Alternative
12	P & R Paper Supply Co.	\$14.78	\$81,290.00	Alternative



BID COMPARISON

RFB #: 07-1920 Janitorial Supplies
 Submission Due Date & Time: 02/27/2020 at 11:00 A.M.
 Completed By: Edith Herrera

No Award
 Award
 Rejected

Description:		Tissue facial cleansing, 2 ply sheets,		
Quantity / UOM:		Qty: 36,000; UOM: Each		
Vendor:		Price / Each	Ext Cost	NOTES
1	American Textile Systems	\$0.94	\$33,840.00	Alternative
2	Complete Office of CA, Inc.	NO BID	NO BID	
3	ECO Sanitary Supplies Inc.	\$1.07	\$38,400.00	
4	GCS Supplies Inc.	\$0.68	\$24,480.00	
5	Grainger	\$1.74	\$62,742.00	
6	Office Depot, Inc.	\$0.54	\$19,284.00	Alternative
7	School Nurse Supply, Inc.	\$0.90	\$32,364.00	
8	Pantelides Dry Foods & Paper Supply	\$0.37	\$13,320.00	??
9	Gale Supply Company	\$0.61	\$21,960.00	
10	Gale Supply Company	\$0.29	\$10,440.00	Alternative
11	WAXIE Sanitary Supply	\$0.83	\$30,024.00	
12	P & R Paper Supply Co.	\$0.42	\$15,120.00	Alternative