

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 12-1617  
 Submission Due Date & Time: 09/13/16, 11:00AM  
 Completed By: Emmeline

No Award
Award
Rejected

## LOT 1

VENDOR NAME	Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Unit Price	Ext Cost	Sales Tax	Total Bid
Project Lead The Way	1	50	Kit	PLTW POE Vex Kit	\$1,570.00	\$78,500.00	\$7,065.00	\$85,565.00
iDesign Solutions	1	50	Kit		\$1,540.00	\$77,000.00	\$6,930.00	\$83,930.00
Sargent Welch	1	50	Kit		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
VEX Robotics	1	50	Kit		\$1,550.00	\$77,500.00	\$6,975.00	\$84,475.00
Fisher Scientific	1	50	Kit		\$1,655.91	\$82,795.50	\$7,451.60	\$90,247.10

## LOT 2

VENDOR NAME	Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Unit Price	Ext Cost	Sales Tax	Total Bid
Project Lead The Way	1	10	BNDL	Vernier POE Bundle	\$1,099.00	\$10,990.00	\$989.10	\$11,979.10
iDesign Solutions	1	10	BNDL		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sargent Welch	1	10	BNDL		\$1,058.50	\$10,585.00	\$952.65	\$11,537.65
VEX Robotics	1	10	BNDL		\$1,550.00	\$15,500.00	\$1,395.00	\$16,895.00
Fisher Scientific	1	10	BNDL		\$1,025.84	\$10,258.40	\$923.26	\$11,181.66