

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617

Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016

Completed By: Erin and Marcos

			LOT 1	NAPA AUTO PARTS		FACTORY MOTOR PARTS		WARREN DISTRIBUTING	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
1	10	Each	Belt	\$11.10	\$111.00	\$13.60	\$136.00	\$10.33	\$103.30
2	4	Each	Belt	\$10.89	\$43.56	\$15.08	\$60.32	\$10.38	\$41.52
3	10	Each	Belt	\$19.20	\$192.00	\$27.26	\$272.60	\$17.85	\$178.50
4	10	Each	Belt	\$22.57	\$225.70	\$30.86	\$308.60	\$20.98	\$209.80
5	10	Each	Hose	\$8.18	\$81.80	\$11.40	\$114.00	\$7.62	\$76.20
6	10	Each	Hose	\$28.20	\$282.00	\$36.70	\$367.00	\$26.22	\$262.20
7	10	Each	Hose	\$13.91	\$139.10	\$18.42	\$184.20	\$12.93	\$129.30
8	10	Each	Hose	\$9.30	\$93.00	\$13.29	\$132.90	\$9.40	\$94.00
9	10	Each	Radiator Cap	\$3.74	\$37.40	\$5.73	\$57.30	\$3.51	\$35.10
10	10	Each	Radiator Cap	\$2.84	\$28.40	\$3.64	\$36.40	\$2.77	\$27.70
11	10	Each	Radiator Cap	\$2.93	\$29.30	\$3.45	\$34.50	\$2.61	\$26.10
12	10	Each	Thermostat	\$6.21	\$62.10	\$5.18	\$51.80	\$9.62	\$96.20
<b>Total Bid</b>					<b>\$1,325.36</b>		<b>\$1,755.62</b>		<b>\$1,279.92</b>

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617

Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016

Completed By: Erin and Marcos

			LOT 2	NAPA AUTO PARTS		FRICTION MATERIALS	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
13	6	Each	Relay Valve Rebuilt	\$28.24	\$169.44	\$74.68	\$448.08
14	6	Each	Relay Valve New	\$109.88	\$659.28	\$145.02	\$870.12
15	6	Each	PPI Valve Rebuilt	\$16.49	\$98.94	\$31.68	\$190.08
16	6	Each	PPI Valve New	\$23.99	\$143.94	\$72.65	\$435.90
17	4	Each	Foot Valve Rebuilt	\$42.03	\$168.12	\$82.66	\$330.64
18	4	Each	Foot Valve New	\$99.38	\$397.52	\$197.46	\$789.84
19	4	Each	Air Compressor Rebuilt	NO BID	NO BID	\$493.40	\$1,973.60
20	6	Each	10" Brake Drum	\$618.04	\$3,708.24	\$623.48	\$3,740.88
21	6	Each	6" Brake Drum	\$190.69	\$1,144.14	\$392.39	\$2,354.34
22	6	Each	6" Brake Shoe	\$32.83	\$196.98	\$25.50	\$153.00
23	6	Each	10" Brake Shoe	\$58.55	\$351.30	\$73.74	\$442.44
24	6	Each	Service Brake Chamber	\$29.74	\$178.44	\$192.67	\$1,156.02
			<b>Total Bid</b>		<b>\$7,216.34</b>		<b>\$12,884.94</b>

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617

Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016

Completed By: Erin and Marcos

			LOT 3	NAPA AUTO PARTS		FACTORY MOTOR PARTS		WARREN DISTRIBUTING	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
25	10	Each	Brake Pad - Premium	\$38.34	\$383.40	\$28.80	\$288.00	\$40.41	\$404.10
26	10	Each	Brake Pad - Premium	\$24.24	\$242.40	\$29.76	\$297.60	\$47.95	\$479.50
27	10	Each	Brake Pad - Premium	\$37.83	\$378.30	\$25.02	\$250.20	\$38.34	\$383.40
28	20	Each	Brake Pad - Ultra Premium	\$34.15	\$683.00	\$41.92	\$838.40	\$51.99	\$1,039.80
29	10	Each	Brake Shoe - Premium	\$31.79	\$317.90	\$19.46	\$194.60	\$28.53	\$285.30
30	20	Each	Brake Rotor - Premium	\$43.15	\$863.00	\$42.56	\$851.20	\$101.75	\$2,035.00
<b>Total Bid</b>					<b>\$2,868.00</b>		<b>\$2,720.00</b>		<b>\$4,627.10</b>

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617

Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016

Completed By: Erin and Marcos

			LOT 4	NAPA AUTO PARTS		FACTORY MOTOR PARTS		WARREN DISTRIBUTING	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
31	4	Each	Valve Cover Gasket	\$7.01	\$28.04	\$8.90	\$35.60	\$11.81	\$47.24
32	4	Each	Valve Cover Gasket	\$6.36	\$25.44	\$8.43	\$33.72	\$11.17	\$44.68
33	4	Each	Timing Chain Cover Gasket	\$8.44	\$33.76	\$10.75	\$43.00	\$14.25	\$57.00
<b>Total Bid</b>					<b>\$87.24</b>		<b>\$112.32</b>		<b>\$148.92</b>

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617

Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016

Completed By: Erin and Marcos

			LOT 5	NAPA AUTO PARTS		FACTORY MOTOR PARTS		WARREN DISTRIBUTING	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
34	4	Each	Bearing	\$29.63	\$118.52	\$51.29	\$205.16	\$23.41	\$93.64
35	4	Each	Bearing	\$18.47	\$73.88	\$31.76	\$127.04	\$14.50	\$58.00
36	4	Each	Bearing	\$27.97	\$111.88	\$59.72	\$238.88	\$27.26	\$109.04
37	4	Each	Seal	\$28.88	\$115.52	\$36.04	\$144.16	\$21.80	\$87.20
38	4	Each	Seal	\$22.76	\$91.04	\$46.67	\$186.68	\$28.24	\$112.96
39	6	Each	Bearing	\$9.72	\$58.32	\$17.59	\$105.54	\$8.02	\$48.12
40	6	Each	Bearing	\$5.80	\$34.80	\$19.49	\$116.94	\$3.65	\$21.90
41	6	Each	Bearing	\$12.72	\$76.32	\$23.47	\$140.82	\$10.71	\$64.26
<b>Total Bid</b>					<b>\$680.28</b>		<b>\$1,265.22</b>		<b>\$595.12</b>

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617

Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016

Completed By: Erin and Marcos

			LOT 6	NAPA AUTO PARTS		WARREN DISTRIBUTING	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
42	6	Each	Alternator	\$66.60	\$399.60	\$67.89	\$407.34
43	6	Each	Alternator	\$135.00	\$810.00	\$61.10	\$366.60
44	6	Each	Alternator	\$118.84	\$713.04	\$149.38	\$896.28
45	6	Each	Ignition Wire	\$25.25	\$151.50	\$26.42	\$158.52
46	6	Each	Coil	\$23.33	\$139.98	\$26.68	\$160.08
47	6	Each	Ignition Wire	\$25.25	\$151.50	\$32.23	\$193.38
48	40	Each	Fuse	\$0.29	\$11.60	\$0.30	\$12.00
49	40	Each	Fuse	\$0.29	\$11.60	\$0.30	\$12.00
50	40	Each	Fuse	\$1.24	\$49.60	\$0.24	\$9.60
51	40	Each	Fuse	\$0.25	\$10.00	\$0.41	\$16.40
52	40	Each	Fuse	\$0.25	\$10.00	\$0.41	\$16.40
53	40	Each	Fuse	\$0.25	\$10.00	\$0.41	\$16.40
54	40	Each	Fuse	\$0.35	\$14.00	\$0.52	\$20.80
55	40	Each	Fuse	\$1.24	\$49.60	\$2.03	\$81.20
56	4	Each	Starter	\$225.00	\$900.00	\$268.50	\$1,074.00
57	4	Each	Starter	\$225.00	\$900.00	\$189.95	\$759.80
58	4	Each	Starter	\$72.71	\$290.84	\$99.15	\$396.60
59	4	Each	Starter	\$225.00	\$900.00	\$178.50	\$714.00
<b>Total Bid</b>					<b>\$5,522.86</b>		<b>\$5,311.40</b>

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617

Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016

Completed By: Erin and Marcos

			LOT 7	NAPA AUTO PARTS		FACTORY MOTOR PARTS		WARREN DISTRIBUTING	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
60	20	Each	Premium Filter	\$2.88	\$57.60	\$1.49	\$29.80	\$2.49	\$49.80
61	20	Each	Premium Filter	\$4.97	\$99.40	\$8.80	\$176.00	\$4.35	\$87.00
62	60	Each	Premium Filter	\$3.12	\$187.20	\$1.44	\$86.40	\$2.70	\$162.00
63	40	Each	Premium Filter	\$2.88	\$115.20	\$1.51	\$60.40	\$2.49	\$99.60
64	15	Each	Premium Filter	\$11.41	\$171.15	\$8.34	\$125.10	\$9.98	\$149.70
65	15	Each	Premium Filter	\$5.03	\$75.45	\$7.79	\$116.85	\$4.39	\$65.85
66	10	Each	Premium Filter	\$5.05	\$50.50	\$5.63	\$56.30	\$4.42	\$44.20
67	10	Each	Premium Filter	\$38.90	\$389.00	\$68.88	\$688.80	\$34.03	\$340.30
68	10	Each	Premium Filter	\$9.60	\$96.00	\$12.32	\$123.20	\$8.39	\$83.90
69	10	Each	Premium Filter	\$14.40	\$144.00	\$11.22	\$112.20	\$12.32	\$123.20
70	10	Each	Premium Filter	\$6.40	\$64.00	\$4.20	\$42.00	\$3.22	\$32.20
71	10	Each	Premium Filter	\$13.20	\$132.00	\$11.22	\$112.20	\$11.13	\$111.30
<b>Total Bid</b>					<b>\$1,581.50</b>		<b>\$1,729.25</b>		<b>\$1,349.05</b>

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617

Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016

Completed By: Erin and Marcos

			LOT 8	NAPA AUTO PARTS		FACTORY MOTOR PARTS		WARREN DISTRIBUTING	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
72	60	Each	Spark Plugs	\$1.46	\$87.60	\$1.48	\$88.80	\$1.84	\$110.40
73	60	Each	Spark Plugs	\$1.46	\$87.60	\$1.48	\$88.80	\$1.84	\$110.40
74	60	Each	Spark Plugs	\$1.46	\$87.60	\$1.48	\$88.80	\$1.84	\$110.40
75	60	Each	Spark Plugs	\$1.46	\$87.60	\$1.48	\$88.80	\$1.84	\$110.40
76	60	Each	Spark Plugs	\$1.46	\$87.60	\$1.48	\$88.80	\$1.84	\$110.40
77	60	Each	Spark Plugs	\$1.46	\$87.60	\$1.48	\$88.80	\$1.67	\$100.20
<b>Total Bid</b>					<b>\$525.60</b>		<b>\$532.80</b>		<b>\$652.20</b>



# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617

Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016

Completed By: Erin and Marcos

			LOT 9	NAPA AUTO PARTS		FACTORY MOTOR PARTS		WARREN DISTRIBUTING	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
78	4	Each	Fuel Pump-Premium	\$15.00	\$60.00	\$21.30	\$85.20	\$17.43	\$69.72
79	4	Each	Fuel Pump-Premium	\$143.24	\$572.96	\$75.93	\$303.72	\$213.03	\$852.12
80	4	Each	Fuel Pump-Premium	\$174.01	\$696.04	\$239.17	\$956.68	\$179.83	\$719.32
81	4	Each	Fuel Pump-Premium	\$83.82	\$335.28	\$321.42	\$1,285.68	\$292.49	\$1,169.96
82	4	Each	Fuel Pump-Premium	\$80.69	\$322.76	\$65.47	\$261.88	\$119.23	\$476.92
<b>Total Bid</b>					<b>\$1,987.04</b>		<b>\$2,893.16</b>		<b>\$3,288.04</b>

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617

Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016

Completed By: Erin and Marcos

			LOT 10	NAPA AUTO PARTS		FACTORY MOTOR PARTS		WARREN DISTRIBUTING	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
83	4	Each	Water Pump-Premium	\$24.64	\$98.56	\$41.74	\$166.96	\$26.57	\$106.28
84	4	Each	Water Pump-Premium	\$32.20	\$128.80	\$70.71	\$282.84	\$82.50	\$330.00
85	4	Each	Water Pump-Premium	\$23.93	\$95.72	\$26.24	\$104.96	\$24.67	\$98.68
86	4	Each	Water Pump-Premium	\$32.20	\$128.80	\$57.96	\$231.84	\$190.57	\$762.28
<b>Total Bid</b>					<b>\$451.88</b>		<b>\$786.60</b>		<b>\$1,297.24</b>

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617  
 Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016  
 Completed By: Erin and Marcos

			LOT 11	NAPA AUTO PARTS		FACTORY MOTOR PARTS		WARREN DISTRIBUTING		BATTERY SYSTEMS	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
87	40	Each	Wipers	\$4.15	\$166.00	\$2.79	\$111.60	\$4.69	\$187.60	\$2.25	\$90.00
88	60	Each	Wipers	\$4.18	\$250.80	\$2.79	\$167.40	\$4.69	\$281.40	\$2.25	\$135.00
89	40	Each	Wipers	\$4.15	\$166.00	\$2.79	\$111.60	\$4.69	\$187.60	\$2.25	\$90.00
90	20	Each	Wipers	\$6.30	\$126.00	\$5.94	\$118.80	\$4.69	\$93.80	\$4.30	\$86.00
<b>Total Bid</b>					<b>\$708.80</b>		<b>\$509.40</b>		<b>\$750.40</b>		<b>\$401.00</b>

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617

Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016

Completed By: Erin and Marcos

			LOT 12	NAPA AUTO PARTS	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost
91	30	Each	Bulb	\$1.01	\$30.30
92	50	Each	Bulb	\$0.43	\$21.50
93	100	Each	Bulb	\$0.53	\$53.00
94	50	Each	Bulb	\$0.55	\$27.50
95	30	Each	Bulb	\$0.99	\$29.70
96	50	Each	Bulb	\$0.69	\$34.50
97	24	Each	Reflector	\$2.52	\$60.48
98	24	Each	Back-up Light	\$5.21	\$125.04
99	24	Each	Brake/Tail Light Assembly	\$3.12	\$74.88
100	24	Each	Light Assembly	\$2.83	\$67.92
101	24	Each	Light Assembly	\$3.16	\$75.84
102	24	Each	Light Assembly	\$1.15	\$27.60
103	24	Each	PM Light	\$2.05	\$49.20
104	10	Each	Switch	\$7.77	\$77.70
105	10	Each	Switch	\$9.89	\$98.90
106	10	Each	Stop/Tail Light	\$25.68	\$256.80
107	10	Each	Turn Signal Light	\$24.11	\$241.10
108	15	Each	Stop/Tail Light	NO BID	NO BID
109	15	Each	Marker Light	\$2.43	\$36.45
110	15	Each	Marker Light	\$9.11	\$136.65
			<b>Total Bid</b>		<b>\$1,525.06</b>

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617  
 Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016  
 Completed By: Erin and Marcos

			LOT 13	NAPA AUTO PARTS		FACTORY MOTOR PARTS		WARREN DISTRIBUTING		BATTERY SYSTEMS		ADVANCED BATTERY SYSTEMS (1)		ADVANCED BATTERY SYSTEMS (2)	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
111	6	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 950 Cold Cranking amps	\$82.88	\$497.28	\$62.86	\$377.16	\$84.87	\$509.22	\$90.50	\$543.00	\$90.20	\$541.20	\$85.00	\$510.00
112	5	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 950 Cold Cranking amps	\$73.51	\$367.55	\$65.37	\$326.85	\$84.87	\$424.35	\$90.50	\$452.50	\$90.20	\$451.00	\$85.00	\$425.00
113	3	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 1000 Cold Cranking amps	\$125.12	\$375.36	\$133.24	\$399.72	\$112.67	\$338.01	\$100.60	\$301.80	\$152.90	\$458.70	\$140.00	\$420.00
114	8	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 575 Cold Cranking amps	\$69.70	\$557.60	\$83.98	\$671.84	\$63.32	\$506.56	\$53.10	\$424.80	\$64.90	\$519.20	\$116.00	\$928.00
115	8	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 675 Cold Cranking amps	\$76.73	\$613.84	\$94.85	\$758.80	\$73.76	\$590.08	\$63.45	\$507.60	\$82.50	\$660.00	\$82.50	\$660.00
116	9	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 720 Cold Cranking amps	\$69.50	\$625.50	\$88.99	\$800.91	\$69.12	\$622.08	\$62.65	\$563.85	\$75.90	\$683.10	\$119.00	\$1,071.00
117	5	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 582 Cold Cranking amps	\$71.07	\$355.35	\$84.54	\$422.70	\$65.73	\$328.65	\$50.06	\$250.30	\$75.90	\$379.50	\$75.90	\$379.50
118	3	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 610 Cold Cranking amps	\$66.33	\$198.99	\$79.94	\$239.82	\$60.33	\$180.99	\$56.26	\$168.78	\$75.90	\$227.70	\$75.90	\$227.70
119	21	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 535 Cold Cranking amps	\$70.76	\$1,485.96	\$78.80	\$1,654.80	\$58.48	\$1,228.08	\$50.20	\$1,054.20	\$51.70	\$1,085.70	\$121.00	\$2,541.00
120	44	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 875 Cold Cranking amps	\$80.23	\$3,530.12	\$103.08	\$4,535.52	\$80.16	\$3,527.04	\$67.65	\$2,976.60	\$73.70	\$3,242.80	\$117.00	\$5,148.00
121	8	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 800 Cold Cranking amps	\$70.23	\$561.84	\$95.90	\$767.20	\$74.57	\$596.56	\$70.91	\$567.28	\$77.00	\$616.00	\$112.00	\$896.00
122	15	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 330 Cold Cranking amps	\$64.99	\$974.85	\$50.43	\$756.45	\$39.20	\$588.00	\$30.10	\$451.50	\$38.50	\$577.50	\$48.00	\$720.00
123	20	Each	Battery, 6 Volt, 225AH 447 MIN@25A TRJ800378	\$90.23	\$1,804.60	\$120.77	\$2,415.40	\$97.15	\$1,943.00	\$104.85	\$2,097.00	\$92.40	\$1,848.00	\$90.00	\$1,800.00
<b>Total Bid</b>					<b>\$11,948.84</b>		<b>\$14,127.17</b>		<b>\$11,382.62</b>		<b>\$10,359.21</b>		<b>\$11,290.40</b>		<b>\$15,726.20</b>
												<b>10% 30 DAYS:</b>	<b>\$10,264.00</b>	<b>Discount:</b>	<b>\$15,611.00</b>

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617  
 Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016  
 Completed By: Erin and Marcos

Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	NAPA AUTO PARTS		FACTORY MOTOR PARTS		WARREN DISTRIBUTING		BATTERY SYSTEMS		ADVANCED BATTERY SYSTEMS (1)		ADVANCED BATTERY SYSTEMS (2)	
				Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost	Each	Ext Cost
124	4	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 950 Cold Cranking amps	\$82.88	\$331.52	\$62.86	\$251.44	\$84.87	\$339.48	\$90.50	\$362.00	\$90.20	\$360.80	\$85.00	\$340.00
125	4	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 660 Cold Cranking amps	\$73.51	\$294.04	\$65.37	\$261.48	\$84.87	\$339.48	\$90.50	\$362.00	\$85.80	\$343.20	\$85.00	\$340.00
126	2	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 575 Cold Cranking amps	\$69.70	\$139.40	\$83.98	\$167.96	\$63.32	\$126.64	\$53.10	\$106.20	\$64.90	\$129.80	\$116.00	\$232.00
127	2	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 675 Cold Cranking amps	\$76.73	\$153.46	\$94.85	\$189.70	\$73.76	\$147.52	\$63.45	\$126.90	\$82.50	\$165.00	\$82.50	\$165.00
128	2	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 800 Cold Cranking amps	\$70.23	\$140.46	\$95.90	\$191.80	\$74.57	\$149.14	\$70.91	\$141.82	\$77.00	\$154.00	\$112.00	\$224.00
129	1	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 720 Cold Cranking amps	\$69.50	\$69.50	\$88.89	\$88.89	\$69.12	\$69.12	\$62.65	\$62.65	\$75.90	\$75.90	\$119.00	\$119.00
130	1	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 550 Cold Cranking amps	\$63.89	\$63.89	\$85.45	\$85.45	\$47.08	\$47.08	\$52.27	\$52.27	\$68.20	\$68.20	\$68.20	\$68.20
131	4	Each	Battery, 12 Volt, 850 Cold Cranking amps	\$80.23	\$320.92	\$103.08	\$412.32	\$80.16	\$320.64	\$67.65	\$270.60	\$73.70	\$294.80	\$117.00	\$468.00
<b>Total Bid</b>					<b>\$1,513.19</b>		<b>\$1,649.04</b>		<b>\$1,539.10</b>		<b>\$1,484.44</b>		<b>\$1,591.70</b>		<b>\$1,956.20</b>
												<b>10% 30 DAYS:</b>	<b>\$1,447.00</b>	<b>Discount:</b>	<b>\$1,935.00</b>

# BID COMPARISON

Solicitation Number: 11-1617  
 Submission Due Date & Time: 10/7/2016  
 Completed By: Erin and Marcos

			LOT 15	NAPA AUTO PARTS	
Item No.	Qty	UOM	Description	Each	Ext Cost
132	6	Each	Spray Paint, Light Green	\$5.98	\$35.88
133	12	Each	Undercoating	\$6.41	\$76.92
134	24	Each	Paint, Gray Engine, Universal	\$5.98	\$143.52
135	144	Each	CRC Brakleen	\$2.39	\$344.16
136	24	Each	Clean-R-Carb, CRC	\$4.87	\$116.88
137	24	Each	Mac's Premium Starting Fluid	\$2.56	\$61.44
138	24	Each	Permatex Gasket Remover	\$5.69	\$136.56
139	48	Each	Gunk Engine Brite Heavy Duty Engine Degreaser	\$3.29	\$157.92
140	24	Each	Throttle Plate and Intake Cleaner, 3M	\$5.61	\$134.64
141	36	Each	Carbon Cleaner, Sea Foam Deep Creep	\$7.99	\$287.64
142	36	Each	Penetrant Lubricant, Sea Foam Deep Creep	\$7.99	\$287.64
143	24	Each	Tar and Bug Remover, Blue Max	\$6.61	\$158.64
144	36	Each	Intake System Cleaner	\$20.85	\$750.60
145	30	Each	Heavy-Duty Brake Fluid, Dot 3 NAPA	\$17.76	\$532.80
146	10	Each	ArmorAll, gallon size	\$37.79	\$377.90
147	24	Each	Loctite, .20 fl. Oz. #217	\$4.49	\$107.76
148	24	Each	Loctite, .20 fl. Oz. #290	\$4.49	\$107.76
149	24	Each	RTV Silicone, 3 Oz., black	\$5.98	\$143.52
150	24	Each	RTV Silicone, 3 Oz., blue	\$6.66	\$159.84
151	24	Each	RTV Silicone, 3 Oz., clear	\$5.98	\$143.52
152	24	Each	RTV Silicone, 3 Oz., high temperature	\$7.06	\$169.44
<b>Total Bid</b>					<b>\$4,434.98</b>